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Psychologically challenged and still stunned by her ex-husband’s decision to file for divorce, Denelle Brown
tells the story of her best friend and college classmate, Nioka Wilson, who is 37, single and childless, and
captivated by what popular literature and media reports insist about black women—they are the least likely
candidates for marriage, the most likely victims of divorce. Nioka endures a personal struggle with being
single in her late-thirties. She is constantly harassed by an overzealous grandmother who pressures her to
marry and have children, even suggesting that Nioka considers freezing her reproductive eggs. This struggle
is reflected in Nioka’s academic pursuits as a sociology doctoral student at Howard University in
Washington, D.C. In a research paper assigned by her professor, Nioka seeks to find cause and effect
between education and marriage rates among black women, testing her hypothesis—that advanced degrees
and high-ranking careers negatively impact marriage and divorce—by analyzing ill-acquired information on
nearly 500 black women who represent her “study subjects.” The submission of her research paper is
ultimately jeopardized; however, Nioka’s “conclusion” becomes a valuable resolve about her own status as a
single, childless black woman, a resolve that she believes can be applied universally to all single black
women pressured by family and society to marry.
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From reader reviews:

Betty Terry:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information presently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a concern. What people must be
consider any time those information which is within the former life are hard to be find than now is taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you obtain
the unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you.
All of those possibilities will not happen within you if you take Marriage is Over-Rated Anyway as the daily
resource information.

Bruce Patton:

This book untitled Marriage is Over-Rated Anyway to be one of several books this best seller in this year,
here is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this
book in the book store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book
too. It makes you easier to read this book, as you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no
reason for you to past this guide from your list.

Donald Vermillion:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try and and must have the extra time or they will get large
amount of stress from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not just a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do
you have when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do
you ever try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, often
the book you have read is Marriage is Over-Rated Anyway.

Wanda Collins:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
from the book. Book is created or printed or illustrated from each source in which filled update of news.
With this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social
similar to newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just trying
to find the Marriage is Over-Rated Anyway when you necessary it?
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