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In Tiva, the compelling sequel to Eye, Tim Black continues the story of a Florida neighborhood marooned in
prehistoric times by a recurrent hurricane whose eye is the vortex of a time tunnel. While the small
community has resourcefully survived the last year by working together, dissension arises when the
neighbors seek a reason for their predicament. Who, or what, has sent their neighborhood intact back 53,000
years? Soon, the neighborhood finds itself divided into two ideological camps. One group seeks explanation
in religion. Have they been saved by God? Was Tiva McFoley chosen for some greater purpose? Is she a
new "Eve"? Others are concerned that darker and more scientific forces may be at play. Are the neighbors
merely guinea pigs in a science experiment conducted by some alien force? Was the mysterious hurricane a
freak of nature, or the work of engineering—an intelligent design by a superior race of beings who can
manipulate the past to speed up their own evolution? Will the neighborhood's very existence in the past
speed up human evolution, or doom humanity to extinction? Will homo sapiens become a missing link to a
superior species? More importantly, however, is the one question both sides are asking: Will all of human
history be erased by the birth of one strange child?
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From reader reviews:

Brent Jones:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive at this point,
people have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded
place and notice by surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated that for a while
is reading. Yes, by reading a publication your ability to survive improve then having chance to remain than
other is high. For yourself who want to start reading the book, we give you this particular Tiva: The Sequel
to EYE book as beginning and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Kathi Adamo:

Reading a book tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world may share their idea.
Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their particular reader with their story or
maybe their experience. Not only the story that share in the publications. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their
skill in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to their book. One of them is this Tiva: The
Sequel to EYE.

Cathy Duran:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you can have it in
e-book means, more simple and reachable. That Tiva: The Sequel to EYE can give you a lot of close friends
because by you looking at this one book you have point that they don't and make you actually more like an
interesting person. That book can be one of one step for you to get success. This guide offer you information
that maybe your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than additional make you to be great people. So , why
hesitate? Let us have Tiva: The Sequel to EYE.

David Packard:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got college students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And
also you know that little person including reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to know
that reading is very important as well as book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to provide you
knowledge, except your own teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update concerning something
by book. Different categories of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is Tiva: The Sequel
to EYE.
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