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The spectacularly successful transformation of Times Square has become a model for other cities. From its
beginning as Longacre Square, Times Square's commercialism, signage, cultural diversity, and social
tolerance have been deeply embedded in New York City's psyche. Its symbolic role guaranteed that any plan
for its renewal would push the hot buttons of public controversy: free speech, property-taking through
eminent domain, development density, tax subsidy, and historic preservation.

In Times Square Roulette, Lynne Sagalyn debunks the myth of an overnight urban miracle performed by
Disney and Mayor Giuliani, to tell the far more complex and commanding tale of a twenty-year process of
public controversy, nonstop litigation, and interminable delay. She tells how the troubled execution of the
original redevelopment plan provided a rare opportunity to rescript it. And timing was all: the mid-1990s saw
rising international corporate interest in the city was a mecca for mass-market entertainment and synergistic
merchandising. Sagalyn details the complex relationship between planning and politics and the role of
market forces in shaping Times Square's redevelopment opportunities. She shows how policy was wedded to
deal making and how persistent individuals and groups forged both.
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From reader reviews:

Shawn Hunter:

Book is written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can learn everything you want by a guide. Book
has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important thing to bring us around the world. Next to
that you can your reading skill was fluently. A book Times Square Roulette: Remaking the City Icon (MIT
Press) will make you to always be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about almost
everything. But some of you think this open or reading any book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why
they can be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or ideal book with you?

Krystal Harris:

The book Times Square Roulette: Remaking the City Icon (MIT Press) can give more knowledge and
information about everything you want. So just why must we leave the great thing like a book Times Square
Roulette: Remaking the City Icon (MIT Press)? A number of you have a different opinion about book. But
one aim this book can give many info for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer with the
book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; it is possible to share
all of these. Book Times Square Roulette: Remaking the City Icon (MIT Press) has simple shape but you
know: it has great and massive function for you. You can search the enormous world by open and read a
book. So it is very wonderful.

Anna Rangel:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information these days can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a expertise or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider if those
information which is inside the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking seriously which one
is acceptable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable resource then you
have it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen throughout you if you take Times Square Roulette: Remaking the City Icon (MIT Press) as the daily
resource information.

Steven Atkins:

Reading a book for being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to learn a book. When you
examine a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, since book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what
kinds of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, in addition
to soon. The Times Square Roulette: Remaking the City Icon (MIT Press) provide you with new experience
in studying a book.
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