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Surrounded by his cat and furry toy animals, Noah wonders aloud, "Why do you get to have fur coats, but I
don't?" In his dream that night, Noah learns how vital each animal's fur coat is to its survival and happiness.
Each fur-bearing animal is shown in its appropriate habitat.

Through light-hearted, engaging, and informative interactions, Friends in Fur Coats tackles the difficult topic
of why using animal fur is inherently inhumane. Children learn in vivid detail what makes each animal’s fur
unique, as well as other facts special to each animal.

The vibrant illustrations and language illuminate and stress the beauty and vitality of real fur-bearing animals
while making a connection to children’s beloved plush toys as stand-ins for animals that need their
protection and care.

Claire Buchwald is the author of four children's picture books, including the Gryphon titles Max Talks to
Me and Are You Ready for Me.

Sarah Buchlaw is making her debut as an author.

Rebecca Evans has illustrated nine previous children's books, including Someday I'll Fly.
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From reader reviews:

John Lee:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be up-date about what going on or details even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move ahead. Some
of you maybe can update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you personally but the
problems coming to an individual is you don't know which one you should start with. This Friends in Fur
Coats is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you
want and need in this era.

Erica Lewis:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Aim to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its protect may doesn't
work is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
look likes. Maybe you answer is usually Friends in Fur Coats why because the amazing cover that make you
consider concerning the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the
outside or even cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Joseph Lee:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside along with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by looking at a
book. Ugh, do you consider reading a book can actually hard because you have to use the book everywhere?
It ok you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Friends in Fur Coats
which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's find.

Crystal Babin:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is named of book
Friends in Fur Coats. You can add your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it could possibly
add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about
book. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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