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Calculate with Confidence has been a success in the marketplace for several reasons. The ratio and
proportion and formula methods, the two most common methods used in clinical practice, are included in the
text, along with an extensive math review and large number of examples and exercises. The second edition
features numerous new drug labels, syringes, and other illustrations, many in full colour to simulate clinical
reality. Critical thinking activities and a "Critical Thinking to Avoid Drug Calculation Errors" feature
encourage application skills. New sections on patient education and home care considerations are added in
Chapter 9. Chapter objectives, a more user-friendly answer key, and perforated and three-hole punched pages
make this book easier to use for both instructors and students.
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From reader reviews:

Aaron Ryan:

Do you among people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys this
particular aren't like that. This Calculate With Confidence book is readable by simply you who hate the
straight word style. You will find the info here are arrange for enjoyable reading experience without leaving
even decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer regarding Calculate With Confidence
content conveys thinking easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
articles but it just different such as it. So , do you continue to thinking Calculate With Confidence is not
loveable to be your top list reading book?

Johnnie Santiago:

The particular book Calculate With Confidence has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you read this book you
can get a lot of advantage. The book was published by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some
research just before write this book. This specific book very easy to read you can get the point easily after
reading this article book.

Omar Stewart:

The reason why? Because this Calculate With Confidence is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve
waiting for you to snap it but latter it will distress you with the secret the item inside. Reading this book
alongside it was fantastic author who all write the book in such wonderful way makes the content inside of
easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you
because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot
of positive aspects than the other book include such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking
technique. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I have been you I will go to the book store
hurriedly.

Anthony Koch:

You could spend your free time to study this book this book. This Calculate With Confidence is simple to
deliver you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not have got much space
to bring the printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save
typically the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this
book.
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