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There are only two elements that make the Universal Cycle Theory radical - cycles and infinity. Other than
that, much of what you read in the book will seem familiar and conventional. The book focuses on these key
elements in the following ways.

Cycles are crucial because they explain how matter moves. Motions develop because of two types of cycles -
vortices and waves. A vortex causes matter to rotate, which produces circular cycles. And waves cause
matter to compress-and-decompress in repeated oscillations, which produce linear cycles. According to the
Universal Cycle Theory, these two basic motions explain much, if not most, of what happens in the universe.

Infinity is crucial because it explains the extent and structure of the universe. Based on logic and
observations, we assume that matter is infinitely divisible and integrable. We also assume that time was
infinite in the past and will be infinite in the future. From the literature, we could not find an example of this
concept of infinity previously employed in a model of the universe. Indeed, this model is unique.
Importantly, it explains many of the paradoxes and contradictions currently riddling physics and cosmology.

This explains the title of our book - Universal Cycle Theory: Neomechanics of the Hierarchically Infinite
Universe. Cycles explain the motions in the universe, infinity explains the hierarchical structure of the
universe, and neomechanics explains the physical laws used in the theory. Think of neomechanics as an
adaptation of classical mechanics to conform to infinity.

The neomechanical worldview offers something that no other theory has to this point - unique insights and
perspectives into some of the most challenging dilemmas facing scientists. For example, the neomechanical
model helped us discover the cause of gravitation. More than three centuries ago, Newton developed an
equation for gravitation. However, no one has ever identified the actual physical cause. The prevailing view,
of course, is that gravity is a pull; whereas, we describe it as a push.

Gravitation follows the inverse-square law, just as Newton said; it involves inertia, just as Einstein said; it
involves pushing, just as Lesage said; it includes vortex motion, just as Descartes said; and it entails aether,
just as many philosophers since the ancient Greeks said. Even though we agree with these old and much-
debated gravitational theories, none of them are adequate. In formulating the neomechanical theory of
gravitation, we took the best from the best, and added a few new ideas. The rest fell into place with little
effort. We discovered that gravitation results from aethereal pressure - nearly the same as air pressure. After
reading the book you will wonder: "Why didn't I think of that myself?"

New theories purporting to explain the universe are common. However, supporting a theory with credible
evidence is another story. This book explains the physical reason for gravitation in great detail. Of course,
gravitation is so basic, and its solution formerly so intractable, that one should expect the discovery of its
physical cause to impinge on the rest of science. As exciting as it is, this discovery only represents the tip of
the iceberg. It also gives solutions to other puzzles by using neomechanics. The revelations included dark
matter, dark energy, dark flow, black-holes, magnetic bonding, molecular bonding, light wave propagation,



geomagnetic reversals, volcanic episodes, climatic cycles, mass-extinction cycles, and much, much more. To
make a long story short, it has too much intriguing content to tell in this brief introduction.
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From reader reviews:

Ruth Ward:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to know everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that e-book has
different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they consider because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Think about the person who
don't like reading through a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book once they found difficult
problem or exercise. Well, probably you'll have this Universal Cycle Theory: Neomechanics of the
Hierarchically Infinite Universe.

Noah Hansell:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the subject Universal Cycle
Theory: Neomechanics of the Hierarchically Infinite Universe suitable to you? The actual book was written
by well-known writer in this era. The particular book untitled Universal Cycle Theory: Neomechanics of the
Hierarchically Infinite Universeis the one of several books that everyone read now. This book was inspired a
lot of people in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new shape that you ever know
previous to. The author explained their idea in the simple way, consequently all of people can easily to know
the core of this guide. This book will give you a large amount of information about this world now. So you
can see the represented of the world within this book.

Luther Brown:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. 1 activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you already been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Universal Cycle Theory:
Neomechanics of the Hierarchically Infinite Universe, it is possible to enjoy both. It is good combination
right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout men. What?
Still don't understand it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Nancy Chinn:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this Universal Cycle Theory: Neomechanics of
the Hierarchically Infinite Universe book written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book
that may be understand by anyone who read the book. Written with good manner for you, leaking every
ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still skepticism Universal Cycle
Theory: Neomechanics of the Hierarchically Infinite Universe as good book but not only by the cover but
also through the content. This is one guide that can break don't ascertain book by its protect, so do you still
needing another sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already said so why you have



to listening to an additional sixth sense.
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