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In the tradition of Jennifer Robson, comes this compelling debut that weaves the fascinating story of a young
woman who must risk her life as a spy to help stop Napoleon’s invasion of Great Britain in the winter of
1803.

Though the daughter of an English baronet, Lisbeth has defied convention by eloping to France with her new
husband. But when he breaks her heart by abandoning her, she has nowhere to turn and must work in a local
tavern. Her only hope for the future is to be reunited with her young son who is being raised by her mother-
in law.

A seasoned spy known by his operatives as Tidewatcher, Duncan apprenticed under Lisbeth’s father and
pledged to watch over his mentor’s only daughter while he searches the Channel region for evidence that
Bonaparte has built a fleet to invade Britain. But unpredictable Lisbeth challenges his lifelong habit of
distance.

Eccentric, brilliant American inventor Robert Fulton is working on David Bushnell’s “turtle”—the first fully
submersible ship—when he creates brand-new torpedo technology, which he plans to sell to the French
Navy. But when his relationship with Bonaparte sours, he accepts Tidewatcher’s help to relocate to the
French side of the Channel, but he refuses to share his invention. With an entire army encamped in the
region, blocking off all access, Tidewatcher must get that submersible, along with someone who knows how
to use it, to uncover Bonaparte’s great secret.

When Lisbeth is asked to pose as a housekeeper and charm Fulton so she can learn to use the submersible
before the invasion fleet sails, she will be forced to sacrifice herself for her country—but is she willing to
sacrifice her heart when she’s already lost it to another…?

A fast-paced, deeply-researched, and richly imagined novel, The Tide Watchers explores a long-hidden,
chapter of Bonaparte’s history.
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From reader reviews:

Steven Resnick:

Throughout other case, little people like to read book The Tide Watchers: A Novel. You can choose the best
book if you appreciate reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important a new book The Tide
Watchers: A Novel. You can add information and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely
right, since from book you can know everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you will end up
known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we can open a book or
perhaps searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel uninterested to go to
the library. Let's read.

Angel Sherrill:

Now a day those who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not demand people to be aware of each info they get. How people have to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Studying a book
can help people out of this uncertainty Information specially this The Tide Watchers: A Novel book because
this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred per-cent
guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Antoine Anderson:

The book with title The Tide Watchers: A Novel includes a lot of information that you can understand it.
You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This book exist new understanding the information that
exist in this guide represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to find out how
the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you in new era of the the positive effect. You
can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Dennis Winters:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our understanding for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every
year ended up being exactly added. This e-book The Tide Watchers: A Novel was filled with regards to
science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some
people has several feel when they reading the book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can sense
enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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