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This map is waterproof and tear-resistant, double-sided to provide the best balance between a good scale and
a convenient sheet size (size 100 x 70 cm / 39.5 x 27.5 in) with topographic and tourist information.

The map covers the Korean Peninsula, with both North and South Korea (including Jejudo Island). It divides
the region north / south, with a generous overlap between the two sides and shows Pyongyang on both sides.
A smal inset map shows Ulleungdo Island.

Contours, relief shading with spot heights and names of mountain ranges present the topography. Road
network shows distances on main routes. Railway lines distinguish standard and high-speed lines. Local
airports are included, and ferry links from South Korea to its outlaying islands and Japan are marked. The
map also shows internal administrative boundaries in both countries with names of the provinces.

National parks or protected areas and numerous other places of interest are highlighted in South Korea.
Within North Kore, only World Heritage sites plus a few ancient temples and Communist memorials are
marked. Latitude and longitude margin ticks are at 30' intervals. Multilingual legend includes English, the
map is indexed and includes a list of national parks. High quality German cartography.
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From reader reviews:

Eva Stanfield:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be update about what going on or data even knowledge to
make all of them keep up with the era which is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe may
update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems coming
to you actually is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Korea South & North 1:700,000
Travel Map, waterproof, GPS-compatible, REISE, 2013 edition is our recommendation so you keep up with
the world. Why, because book serves what you want and want in this era.

Corey Ison:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside the straightway,
hold on guys this particular aren't like that. This Korea South & North 1:700,000 Travel Map, waterproof,
GPS-compatible, REISE, 2013 edition book is readable through you who hate the perfect word style. You
will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable looking at experience without leaving actually decrease the
knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer connected with Korea South & North 1:700,000 Travel
Map, waterproof, GPS-compatible, REISE, 2013 edition content conveys thinking easily to understand by
many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just different as it. So , do you
even now thinking Korea South & North 1:700,000 Travel Map, waterproof, GPS-compatible, REISE, 2013
edition is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Cynthia Briscoe:

Typically the book Korea South & North 1:700,000 Travel Map, waterproof, GPS-compatible, REISE, 2013
edition will bring that you the new experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to elucidate the
idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book you just read, this book very appropriate to you. The
book Korea South & North 1:700,000 Travel Map, waterproof, GPS-compatible, REISE, 2013 edition is
much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you
can quicker to read the book.

Bonnie Vassallo:

Is it you who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Korea South & North 1:700,000 Travel Map,
waterproof, GPS-compatible, REISE, 2013 edition can be the response, oh how comes? A book you know.
You are thus out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this completely new era is common not a
nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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