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This book argues that recent developments in contemporary comedy have changed not just the way we
laugh, but the way we understand the world. Drawing on a range of contemporary televisual, cinematic and
digital examples, from Seinfeld and Veep to Family Guy and Chappelle’s Show, Holm explores how humour
has become a central site of cultural politics in the twenty-first century. More than just a form of
entertainment, humour has come to play a central role in the contemporary media environment, shaping how
we understand ideas of freedom, empathy, social boundaries and even logic. Through an analysis of humour
as a political and aesthetic category, Humour as Politics challenges older models of laughter as a form of
dissent and instead argues for a new theory of humour as the cultural expression of our (neo)liberal moment. 
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From reader reviews:

Joyce Murphy:

Do you among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys this
aren't like that. This Humour as Politics: The Political Aesthetics of Contemporary Comedy (Palgrave
Studies in Comedy) book is readable by you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the information
here are arrange for enjoyable looking at experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that
want to deliver to you. The writer connected with Humour as Politics: The Political Aesthetics of
Contemporary Comedy (Palgrave Studies in Comedy) content conveys prospect easily to understand by
many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different by means of it. So ,
do you continue to thinking Humour as Politics: The Political Aesthetics of Contemporary Comedy
(Palgrave Studies in Comedy) is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Rebecca Walton:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, limited story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not hoping Humour as Politics: The Political
Aesthetics of Contemporary Comedy (Palgrave Studies in Comedy) that give your pleasure preference will
be satisfied through reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the way for people
to know world considerably better then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be claimed
constantly that reading routine only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to be success person. So ,
for all you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you can pick Humour as Politics: The Political
Aesthetics of Contemporary Comedy (Palgrave Studies in Comedy) become your personal starter.

Keith Karam:

The book untitled Humour as Politics: The Political Aesthetics of Contemporary Comedy (Palgrave Studies
in Comedy) contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains your ex idea with easy approach. The
language is very clear to see all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read it. The book was
authored by famous author. The author provides you in the new period of time of literary works. You can
easily read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book with
anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their official web-site in
addition to order it. Have a nice read.

Rick Fairchild:

Publication is one of source of understanding. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but
native or citizen want book to know the change information of year for you to year. As we know those
ebooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. From the
book Humour as Politics: The Political Aesthetics of Contemporary Comedy (Palgrave Studies in Comedy)
we can consider more advantage. Don't that you be creative people? Being creative person must choose to



read a book. Simply choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to
change your life with that book Humour as Politics: The Political Aesthetics of Contemporary Comedy
(Palgrave Studies in Comedy). You can more pleasing than now.
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