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A reform-school runaway at thirteen, a performer in the legendary New York City Playhouse of the
Ridiculous at seventeen, and an escapee from Andy Warhol's Factory scene at nineteen, Penny Arcade (born
Susanna Ventura) emerged in the 1980s as a primal force on the New York art scene and an originator of
what came to be called performance art. Arcade's brand of high camp and street-smart, punk-rock cabaret
showmanship has been winning over international audiences ever since. This autobiographical trilogy of
plays represents her at her best.Bitch!Dyke!Faghag!Whore!, is Penny Arcade's raucous, cutting-edge sex and
censorship show, (which continues to be a commercial hit around the world), featuring the daily life of a
receptionist in a brothel, the upbringing and rearing of a "faghag," the evolution of the New York gay scene
in the 1990s, and a participatory "audience dance break." The funny and heart-rending title work, Bad
Reputation, portrays a young teen runaway's coming of age in a Catholic reform school (run by nuns who are
former fashion models) and her subsequent life on the streets of 1960s New York. La Miseria, a rare
depiction of working-class Italian-Americans from a woman's point of view that portrays the clash between
working-class morals and compassion during the 1980s AIDS epidemic, rounds out the trilogy.Bad
Reputation is the first book by and on Penny Arcade. The complete scripts are accompanied by a new
interview with Penny Arcade by Chris Kraus, a range of archival photographs of the East Village scene and
Arcade's performances, an introduction by playwright Ken Bernard, and contributions by Sarah Schulman,
Steve Zehentner, and Stephen Bottoms.
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From reader reviews:

Mamie Wilson:

This book untitled Bad Reputation: Performances, Essays, Interviews (Semiotext(e) / Native Agents) to be
one of several books in which best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this guide you
can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retail store or you can
order it via online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book,
since you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason to your account to past this e-book
from your list.

Edward McCain:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this Bad Reputation: Performances, Essays,
Interviews (Semiotext(e) / Native Agents) book written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to
make book that can be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written inside good manner for you,
still dripping wet every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still
uncertainty Bad Reputation: Performances, Essays, Interviews (Semiotext(e) / Native Agents) as good book
not simply by the cover but also by content. This is one e-book that can break don't determine book by its
protect, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense
already said so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Effie Peoples:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information easier to
share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon. You
can see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended to you
is Bad Reputation: Performances, Essays, Interviews (Semiotext(e) / Native Agents) this guide consist a lot
of the information from the condition of this world now. That book was represented so why is the world has
grown up. The terminology styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some
investigation when he makes this book. This is why this book suited all of you.

Lisa Walker:

Reserve is one of source of knowledge. We can add our information from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen need book to know the update information of year to be able to year. As we know those
books have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world.
By book Bad Reputation: Performances, Essays, Interviews (Semiotext(e) / Native Agents) we can have
more advantage. Don't that you be creative people? To be creative person must love to read a book. Merely
choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life by this book Bad
Reputation: Performances, Essays, Interviews (Semiotext(e) / Native Agents). You can more appealing than



now.
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