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Tomorrow morning, you and Frank Armitage are getting wed. In my opinion, marriage is blind optimism at
any time, but especially in wartime. It's an act of faith.

Taking its title from a line in Philip Larkin's poem 'MCMXIV', An August Bank Holiday Lark explores the
impact of the First World War on a rural community in East Lancashire.

Set in the idyllic summer of 1914 rural Lancashire, everyone in the community is excited about Wakes week;
a rest from field and mill and a celebration of the Rushbearing Festival with singing, courting, drinking and
dancing. The looming war barely registers . . . but it will.

Through the lens of traditional rural life, the play follows the stories of the people of the village and
witnesses their personal transitions from exuberance to touching naivety as they manage their loss with
courage and humanity.

An August Bank Holiday Lark received its world premiere on 7 February 2014, in a touring production by
Northern Broadsides and New Vic Theatre.
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From reader reviews:

Harvey Hobbs:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As you may
know that book is very important for people. The book An August Bank Holiday Lark (Modern Plays) had
been making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is very
advantages for you. The book An August Bank Holiday Lark (Modern Plays) is not only giving you far more
new information but also to be your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your personal spend
time to read your publication. Try to make relationship using the book An August Bank Holiday Lark
(Modern Plays). You never really feel lose out for everything if you read some books.

Ronnie Miller:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this An August Bank Holiday Lark
(Modern Plays) reserve written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that could be
understand by anyone who also read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, dripping every
ideas and producing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still hesitation An August Bank
Holiday Lark (Modern Plays) as good book but not only by the cover but also from the content. This is one
guide that can break don't determine book by its cover, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick
this specific!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to a
different sixth sense.

Earl Sanders:

This An August Bank Holiday Lark (Modern Plays) is great guide for you because the content which can be
full of information for you who have always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This
book reveal it facts accurately using great arrange word or we can say no rambling sentences inside it. So if
you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with
straight forward sentences but challenging core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having An
August Bank Holiday Lark (Modern Plays) in your hand like finding the world in your arm, details in it is
not ridiculous 1. We can say that no book that offer you world within ten or fifteen tiny right but this reserve
already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt that will?

Maryellen Tilley:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt this when they get
a half elements of the book. You can choose the particular book An August Bank Holiday Lark (Modern
Plays) to make your own reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading expertise is developing when you
similar to reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the opinion about book
and reading through especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to open up a book and go through it.
Beside that the e-book An August Bank Holiday Lark (Modern Plays) can to be your brand-new friend when
you're feel alone and confuse in what must you're doing of this time.
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