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Mojo Triangle Travel Guide focuses on the origins of America's original music. The Mojo Triangle, a
geographical and cultural area located within a triangular connection between New Orleans, Nashville and
Memphis, is the birthplace of country, blues, jazz, and rock ‘n’ roll. The Mojo Triangle has presented the
world with an astonishing array of music.

The triangular concept of defining American music was originated by author James L. Dickerson in the early
2000s after decades of writing about the music created in the South. In 2005 he published a book, Mojo
Triangle, that was named the best non-fiction work in the South by the Independent Publishers Association
and presented with an IPPY Award. The book was updated and reprinted in 2014.

Mojo Triangle Travel Guide takes the historical information presented in Dickerson's work and presents a
road map for tourists to explore the historic triangle for the purpose of understanding America's impressive
contributions to music. The book is divided into seven chapters:

Chapter 1 New Orleans

Chapter 2 Natchez

Chapter 3 Natchez Trace

Chapter 4 Mississippi Delta

Chapter 5 Memphis

Chapter 6 Muscle Shoals

Chapter 7 Nashville

Each chapter begins with a brief explanation for the destination area's contribution to music and brief bios of
the recording artists from each area, followed by practical information about where travelers should go to
find music venues, restaurants, and places to spend the night.

From the bright lights of the major cities in the Triangle to the country crossroads of Mississippi, this book
provides you with the information you will need to plan a memorable vacation or a week-end adventure you
will never forget.
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From reader reviews:

Kimberly Gonzalez:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As you may know that
book is very important normally. The book Mojo Triangle Travel Guide has been making you to know about
other expertise and of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you. The e-book Mojo
Triangle Travel Guide is not only giving you considerably more new information but also being your friend
when you experience bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your reserve. Try to make
relationship using the book Mojo Triangle Travel Guide. You never sense lose out for everything in the
event you read some books.

Hilton Rogers:

Is it a person who having spare time then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Mojo Triangle Travel Guide can be the respond to, oh
how comes? A fresh book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this
completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Christina Pena:

With this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more valuable than other.
Do you want to become among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you are related is just spending
your time not very much but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of the books in the top collection
in your reading list will be Mojo Triangle Travel Guide. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Hills can
get you closer in getting precious person. By looking right up and review this e-book you can get many
advantages.

John Keaney:

A lot of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a book. They are directly felt it when they
get a half parts of the book. You can choose the book Mojo Triangle Travel Guide to make your current
reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading talent is developing when you such as reading. Try to
choose very simple book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the feeling about book and looking at
especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to open a book and read it. Beside that the book Mojo
Triangle Travel Guide can to be your brand new friend when you're really feel alone and confuse in doing
what must you're doing of the time.
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