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"This is a comprehensive resource for anyone interested in integrating gaming and simulation into a course
or the entire curricula. It presents the theory and the associated practical application. The extensive reference
list and resource/product list encourage and support readers with implementation." Score: 98, 5 Stars.--
Doody's Medical Reviews

"Game-Based Teaching and Simulation in Nursing and Healthcare is a timely, exhaustive look at how
emerging technologies are transforming clinical education. Anyone looking for firsthand, direct account of
how game-based learning technologies are reshaping clinical practice needs this book."

Kurt Squire, PhD
Associate Professor
Games+Learning+Society [GLS]
School of Education
University Of Wisconsin - Madison

This innovative text provides practical strategies for developing, integrating, and evaluating new and
emerging technology, specifically game-based learning methods, useful in nursing and clinical health
sciences education. The text draws upon existing models of experiential learning such as Benner's "thinking-
in-action" and "novice-to-expert" frameworks, and introduces current theories supporting the phenomenon of
the created learning environment.

Chapters explain how simulation and game-based learning strategies can be designed, implemented, and
evaluated to improve clinical educational thinking and outcomes and increase exposure to critical
experiences to inform clinicians during the journey from novice to expert. The text also describes how game-
based learning methods can support the development of complex decision-making and critical thinking
skills. Case studies throughout demonstrate the practical application of harnessing technology as a
teaching/learning device.

Key Features:

Provides strategies for developing, integrating, and evaluating game-based learning methods for nursing●

and healthcare educators
Prepares teachers for the paradigm shift from static "e-learning" to dynamic distance experiential learning●

in virtual and game-based environments
Illustrates how to integrate game-based learning into existing curricula●

Offers theoretical and practical examples of how game-based learning technologies can be used in nursing●

and clinical education
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From reader reviews:

Neil Turner:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also become a life style. This reading addiction give you
lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the
book which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of publication
you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want sense
happy read one having theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Typically the Game-Based
Teaching and Simulation in Nursing and Health Care is kind of publication which is giving the reader erratic
experience.

Yadira Singh:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the subject Game-Based
Teaching and Simulation in Nursing and Health Care suitable to you? The particular book was written by
popular writer in this era. Often the book untitled Game-Based Teaching and Simulation in Nursing and
Health Careis the main of several books that will everyone read now. This book was inspired many people in
the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know previous to.
The author explained their thought in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to recognise the core of
this e-book. This book will give you a great deal of information about this world now. To help you see the
represented of the world with this book.

Morgan Lytle:

The reason why? Because this Game-Based Teaching and Simulation in Nursing and Health Care is an
unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap it but latter it will zap you with the secret
that inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who write the book in such awesome way makes
the content inside of easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is
good for you because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This phenomenal
book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book get such as help improving your proficiency and
your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I have been you I will go to
the e-book store hurriedly.

Jessie Loudermilk:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Attempt to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't assess book by its handle may doesn't work at
this point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the
outside search likes. Maybe you answer is usually Game-Based Teaching and Simulation in Nursing and
Health Care why because the wonderful cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not
disappoint you actually. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your



reading 6th sense will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.
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