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Fifteen-year-old Alyx Atlas was raised as a boy, but she knows something others don’t: she’s a girl. Born
intersex, Alyx has always questioned her gender identity and struggled to fit in. But it’s after her dad
dies—and after she sustains a terrible beating from her classmates—that she decides she can’t live as a boy
any longer. She and her mother move from California to Wisconsin to start a new life, and Alyx begins
again, this time as a girl.

Alyx quickly earns a spot on the girls’ varsity basketball team, and for the first time in her life she feels like
she fits in. But as the team racks up one victory after another and the state championships approach, a jealous
teammate sets her sights on Alyx. Hotheaded and fiercely competitive, Pepper Pitmani is sure Alyx is
keeping a secret, which Pepper is determined to reveal. If she succeeds, the truth could destroy Alyx’s one
shot—not just to take home the trophy with her team but to live as her true self.

Honest, raw, and uplifting, Double Exposure is for every teen who’s longed to be seen, struggled to find the
courage to be different, or dared to face adversity head-on.

Sky Pony Press, with our Good Books, Racehorse and Arcade imprints, is proud to publish a broad range of
books for young readers—picture books for small children, chapter books, books for middle grade readers,
and novels for young adults. Our list includes bestsellers for children who love to play Minecraft; stories told
with LEGO bricks; books that teach lessons about tolerance, patience, and the environment, and much more.
While not every title we publish becomes a New York Times bestseller or a national bestseller, we are
committed to books on subjects that are sometimes overlooked and to authors whose work might not
otherwise find a home.
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From reader reviews:

Janette Collins:

Here thing why this Double Exposure are different and reliable to be yours. First of all examining a book is
good but it really depends in the content from it which is the content is as delicious as food or not. Double
Exposure giving you information deeper including different ways, you can find any book out there but there
is no reserve that similar with Double Exposure. It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your
current eyes about the thing in which happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. It
is easy to bring everywhere like in park your car, café, or even in your technique home by train. If you are
having difficulties in bringing the branded book maybe the form of Double Exposure in e-book can be your
substitute.

Wendell Darnell:

Typically the book Double Exposure will bring that you the new experience of reading some sort of book.
The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book to read, this book
very ideal to you. The book Double Exposure is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-
book from official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Lori Barnes:

You may spend your free time to study this book this publication. This Double Exposure is simple to bring
you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not get much space to
bring often the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save the
actual book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

James Turco:

Beside this Double Exposure in your phone, it could give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge
or facts. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh in the oven so don't possibly be worry
if you feel like an older people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have Double Exposure because
this book offers to your account readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you seldom get what
it's exactly about. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable
arrangement here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to
miss this? Find this book in addition to read it from right now!
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