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Meaning; hidden, or spurious. The name given to certain ancient books which found a place in the LXX. and
Latin Vulgate versions of the Old Testament, and were appended to all the great translations made from them
in the sixteenth century.
 The Old Testament Apocrypha generally consists of fourteen books, the chief of which are the Books of the
Maccabees (q.v.), the Books of Esdras, the Book of Wisdom, the Book of Baruch, the Book of Esther,
Ecclesiasticus, Tobit, Judith, etc. The term apocrypha is used with various meanings, including "hidden",
"esoteric", "spurious", "of questionable authenticity", ancient Chinese "revealed texts and objects" and
"Christian texts that are not canonical".

The general term is usually applied to the books in the Roman Catholic Bible, and the Eastern Orthodox
Bible, but not the Protestant Bible on their claim that it is not God's word. As such, it is misleading in this
sense to refer to the Gospel according to the Hebrews or Gnostic writings as apocryphal, because they would
not be classified in the same category by orthodox believers: they would be classified as a heretical subset of
antilegomenae, to distinguish them from now-canonical ancient antilegomenae such as 2 Peter, 3 John and
the Revelation of John, and non-canonical but non-heretical books which were quoted by the Early Fathers
such as the pseudepigraphic Epistle of Barnabas, the Didache, or The Shepherd of Hermas. The gnostic
writings are generally not accorded any status, not even a negative one: they are ignored, as they are
incompatible with the accepted canon prima facie. Non-canonical books are texts of uncertain authenticity,
or writings where the work is seriously questioned. Given that different denominations have different beliefs
about what constitutes canonical scripture, there are several versions of the apocrypha. During 16th-century
controversies about the biblical canon, the word acquired a negative connotation, and has become a synonym
for "spurious" or "false". This usage usually involves fictitious or legendary accounts that are plausible
enough to be commonly considered true.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Rubio:

The book The Apocrypha: [King James Version] can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. Why must we leave the best thing like a book The Apocrypha: [King
James Version]? A few of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim in which book can give
many details for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or facts that
you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you could share all of these. Book The Apocrypha:
[King James Version] has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and massive function for you.
You can appearance the enormous world by start and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Shirley Eagle:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot
of information which will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can easily share
their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their reader with their
story as well as their experience. Not only the story that share in the publications. But also they write about
the knowledge about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your children, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors in this world always try to
improve their proficiency in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to the book. One of
them is this The Apocrypha: [King James Version].

George Chadwick:

This The Apocrypha: [King James Version] is brand new way for you who has attention to look for some
information since it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more
you know or else you who still having bit of digest in reading this The Apocrypha: [King James Version] can
be the light food for you personally because the information inside this particular book is easy to get simply
by anyone. These books build itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book contact
form. People who think that in e-book form make them feel tired even dizzy this book is the answer. So there
is not any in reading a guide especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for
an individual. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book sort for your better life in addition to knowledge.

Kaye Reynolds:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many question for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book but in addition novel and The Apocrypha: [King James Version] or maybe
others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel wish to
read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or students especially. Those publications are
helping them to include their knowledge. In additional case, beside science reserve, any other book likes The
Apocrypha: [King James Version] to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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