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World War One expanded the use of airplanes from observation platforms to viable fighting machines. As
the air war expanded, Allied aircraft manufacturers turned to America as a source of airplane lumber.
Primarily, they sought Sitka spruce, a strong, lightweight wood found in the coastal rain forests of Oregon
and Washington states. When the United States entered the war in 1917, the Pacific Northwest lumber
industry was supplying the Allies with the majority of airplane-grade lumber. The U.S. Military Draft,
beginning in May of 1917, caused a dramatic reduction of experienced personnel from the woods and mills,
who could not easily be replaced. In August, violent labor strikes across the Pacific Northwest virtually shut
down the lumber industry. To address these problems, the U.S. Army formed the Spruce Production
Division. The Division was designed to provide for the labor needs of the lumber industry and to act as an
armed deterrent against any further labor disruptions. The Division also formed the Loyal Legion of Loggers
& Lumbermen union in order to address the severe labor unrest within the lumber industry. Soldiers in the
Woods is the story of the U.S. Army s Spruce Production Division, and that of the men who worked in the
forests and mills of the Pacific Northwest, producing enormous amounts of airplane-grade spruce lumber for
the war effort.
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From reader reviews:

David Pimentel:

The event that you get from Soldiers in the Woods may be the more deep you looking the information that
hide within the words the more you get serious about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to
recognise but Soldiers in the Woods giving you joy feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point
in specific way that can be understood simply by anyone who read the item because the author of this reserve
is well-known enough. This specific book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy
to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having
this particular Soldiers in the Woods instantly.

Lauren Cook:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, paper, book,
and soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The actual book
that recommended for your requirements is Soldiers in the Woods this reserve consist a lot of the information
of the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented how can the world has grown up. The
language styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some
research when he makes this book. That is why this book acceptable all of you.

William McNeill:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-
book means, more simple and reachable. That Soldiers in the Woods can give you a lot of close friends
because by you considering this one book you have matter that they don't and make anyone more like an
interesting person. This kind of book can be one of a step for you to get success. This reserve offer you
information that possibly your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than other make you to be great
people. So , why hesitate? Let's have Soldiers in the Woods.

Jim Molnar:

As a college student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or make
summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's soul or real their
interest. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right now there but
nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that
on this period, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
So , this Soldiers in the Woods can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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