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Powerful, mesmerizing narrative of the life of an African-born slave
 
"St. Augustine during the nineteenth century has been described for us by many a resident and traveler, but
never so pungently and colorfully as by Sitiki, renamed Uncle Jack, an African American who passed from
slave in the first half of the century to freedman in the second."--Michael Gannon, author of Florida: A Short
History
 
"Griffin presents Sitiki/Smith's narrative, his life and his times, with sensitivity, respect, and accuracy. A
revealing autobiography of a remarkable man."--Jim Miller, former state archaeologist and chief of the
Bureau of Archaeological Research
 
"As the only first-person slave narrative to emerge from Florida, this volume offers us a human perspective
on the experience of enslavement and relocation and tells the story of a remarkable man."--Aaron Sheehan-
Dean, author of Why Confederates Fought

 
Recently discovered as a hand-written document in the Buckingham Smith Collection at the New-York
Historical Society, this remarkable first-person narrative traces the life of Sitiki, whose name was changed to
Jack Smith after his enslavement in America.
 
Captured and sold into slavery in Africa as a five-year-old, Sitiki travelled to America as a cabin boy.
Eventually sold by the ship's captain to Josiah Smith of Savannah, Georgia, he lived there and in Connecticut
with his new master. Captured by the British during the War of 1812, he was returned to the Smiths, to be
freed only after the Civil War. He went on to become the first black Methodist minister in St. Augustine,
Florida where he established his own church.
 
Patricia Griffin does not leave the story at the conclusion of the slave narrative, but explores Sitiki's
experiences and places them in clear and valuable context. She presents the narrative unencumbered,
allowing Sitiki's authority, compassion, and personality to speak for itself.
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From reader reviews:

Kimberly Franks:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be revise about what going on or details even knowledge
to make these keep up with the era and that is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe can
update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to you
actually is you don't know which one you should start with. This The Odyssey of an African Slave is our
recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and need in
this era.

Elizabeth Pipkin:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also get a life style. This reading addiction give you lot of
advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the book
that will improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of e-book you
read, if you want get more knowledge just go with training books but if you want experience happy read one
using theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The actual The Odyssey of an African Slave is kind of
book which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Marlys Wieland:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many problem for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people
likes reading, not only science book and also novel and The Odyssey of an African Slave or maybe others
sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel wish to read
more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or students especially. Those books are helping them
to increase their knowledge. In additional case, beside science book, any other book likes The Odyssey of an
African Slave to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Shirley Bishop:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got learners? We believe that that query was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person just like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You must know that
reading is very important in addition to book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to increase you
knowledge, except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update about
something by book. Amount types of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is niagra
The Odyssey of an African Slave.
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