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Laminated quick reference guide showing step-by-step instructions and shortcuts for how to use Microsoft
Windows Vista.

The following topics are covered:
Starting a Program, Pinning a Program to the Start Menu, Unpinning a Program, Removing a Recently Used
Program, Using Accessories (e.g. Calculator, Note Pad), Exiting a Program, Closing a Window,
Manipulating Windows: Moving, Enlarging, Restoring, Minimizing, Restoring a Minimized
Window/Switching among Open Items, Using Grouped Taskbar Buttons, Showing the Desktop, Displaying
the Shortcut Menu, Getting Help or Support
Saving Documents: Save vs. Save As, Viewing the Status of Print Jobs, Creating a Shortcut to a Document,
Folder, or Other Item, Customize the Start Menu & Taskbar, Moving Items in the Start Menu, What to Try if
a Program Freezes, Showing the Properties or Attributes of an Item, File Management, Changing Views,
Show/Hide Menu Bar, Show Files in Groups, Show/Hide the Folders List, Selecting Items, Moving or
Copying Files and Folders, Renaming Folders or Files, Creating a Folder, Deleting Folders or Files,
Retrieving Items from the Recycle Bin, Emptying the Recycle Bin, Searching for a File, Folder, Program, or
Web Page, Burning to a CD/DVD, Zipping files/folders, Using the Control Panel, Ending your Windows
Sessions, and Changing Login Password.
This guide is suitable as a training handout, or simply an easy to use reference guide, for any type of user.
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From reader reviews:

Gloria Duncan:

What do you consider book? It is just for students since they are still students or this for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
different personality and hobby per other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't desire
do that. You must know how great and important the book Microsoft Windows Vista Quick Reference Guide
(Cheat Sheet of Instructions, Tips & Shortcuts - Laminated Card). All type of book could you see on many
options. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Norma Dickerson:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until adult are different content. To be sure that
book is very important for us. The book Microsoft Windows Vista Quick Reference Guide (Cheat Sheet of
Instructions, Tips & Shortcuts - Laminated Card) was making you to know about other know-how and of
course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The publication Microsoft Windows
Vista Quick Reference Guide (Cheat Sheet of Instructions, Tips & Shortcuts - Laminated Card) is not only
giving you much more new information but also to become your friend when you really feel bored. You can
spend your own spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship while using book Microsoft
Windows Vista Quick Reference Guide (Cheat Sheet of Instructions, Tips & Shortcuts - Laminated Card).
You never feel lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Beatrice Rogers:

This book untitled Microsoft Windows Vista Quick Reference Guide (Cheat Sheet of Instructions, Tips &
Shortcuts - Laminated Card) to be one of several books that will best seller in this year, here is because when
you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the
book store or you can order it through online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes you
easier to read this book, because you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason to
you personally to past this book from your list.

Sebrina Knapp:

Why? Because this Microsoft Windows Vista Quick Reference Guide (Cheat Sheet of Instructions, Tips &
Shortcuts - Laminated Card) is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap it but
latter it will shock you with the secret the item inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who
else write the book in such amazing way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining
method but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this
nowadays or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of gains than the other book
possess such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking method. So , still want to hesitate
having that book? If I have been you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.
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