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Well, Shut My Mouth! The Sweet Potatoes Restaurant Cookbook is recipes - recipes form the restaurant,
recipes from the families of chef Stephanie Tyson and co-owner Vivian Joiner, recipes that are Southern,
plain and simple.

In creating the recipes for Sweet Potatoes, Tyson used all of her influences-Geechee flavor from Joiner's
father, who was from the Hilton Head area of South Carolina; her mother's working-woman "out of the can
and into the pan" shortcuts; and her training in culinary arts at Baltimore International College and her later
work in South Carolina, the Florida Keys, Arizona, and Maryland.

Just the names of the recipes in this book are enough to whet one's appetite: Pimento Cheese Fondue; Sweet
Potato, Corn, and Country Ham Risotto; Gullah Shrimp and Crab Pilau; Slow Cooker Chocolate Stout Pot
Roast; Down-Home 'Tata Salad; Molasses Dijon Dressing; Sweet Potato Bread Pudding with Pecan Crunch
Topping; and many others. Most recipes include a bit of flavorful commentary from the chef, such as this tip
for Spicy Greens: "If you are faint of heart (burn), eliminate the red pepper altogether." Or the brief
definition that introduces Crackling Cornbread: "cracklings are deep-fried crispy skins of various animals -
in this case, pork."

Well Shut My Mouth! is also the history of the two women who started a locally and nationally acclaimed
restaurant (Our State, Southern Living, New York Times). As Tyson says in her introduction, "Every part of
me is a part of Sweet Potatoes." In Well Shut My Mouth! she shares a culinary experience that has been a
favorite of Winston-Salem natives and visitors for years. Now, patrons have the tools to re-create the Sweet
Potatoes dining experience in their own homes.
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From reader reviews:

John Harrison:

This book untitled Well, Shut My Mouth!: The Sweet Potatoes Restaurant Cookbook to be one of several
books this best seller in this year, here is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit upon
it. You will easily to buy that book in the book retail store or you can order it by means of online. The
publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, as you can read this book
in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this book from your list.

Kim Gray:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book when compared
with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all of this time you only find guide that need more
time to be go through. Well, Shut My Mouth!: The Sweet Potatoes Restaurant Cookbook can be your answer
because it can be read by an individual who have those short extra time problems.

John Herrera:

The book untitled Well, Shut My Mouth!: The Sweet Potatoes Restaurant Cookbook contain a lot of
information on it. The writer explains her idea with easy means. The language is very easy to understand all
the people, so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was published by famous
author. The author gives you in the new period of literary works. You can actually read this book because
you can please read on your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book inside anywhere and
anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open up their official web-site along with order it. Have a
nice read.

Cathy Kerby:

As a scholar exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library or to
make summary for some book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart and soul or
real their pastime. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to presently there but
nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on
this period, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore , this Well, Shut My Mouth!: The Sweet Potatoes Restaurant Cookbook can make you
truly feel more interested to read.
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