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"An ingeniously plotted, beautifully written and hugely enjoyable book that raises tricky questions about...
our need for heroes [and] the price of personal compromise.'"?The Daily Telegraph

For the first time since his much-beloved tale Hemingway's Chair was published in 1998, Michael Palin pens
a new novel featuring the warm and witty story of an everyman, a tantalizing offer, a journey to India, and
the search for the truth.

Keith Mabbut is at a crossroads in his life. A professional writer of some repute, he has reached the age of
fifty-six with nothing resembling the success of his two great literary heroes, George Orwell and Albert
Camus. When he is offered the opportunity of a lifetime?to write the biography of the elusive Hamish
Melville, a widely respected and highly influential activist and humanitarian?he seizes the chance to write
something meaningful. His search to find out the real story behind the legend takes Mabbut to the lush
landscapes and environmental hotspots of India.

The more he discovers about Melville, the more he admires him?and the more he connects with an idealist
who wanted to make a difference. But is his quarry really who he claims to be? As Keith discovers, the truth
can be whatever we make it.

In this wonderful, heartwarming novel, Michael Palin turns his considerable skills to fiction in the story of an
ordinary man on an extraordinary adventure.

"[Palin's] book is well paced, his prose, carefully hewn, his characters fully developed and convincingly
human. And his comic timing is impeccable." ?The Washington Post on Hemingway's Chair

"This book's strengths are . . . its dry, deftly, understated wit, its careful plot and character construction; it's
clever, on-the-money dialogue . . . Those pleasures carry you a long way." ?The New York Times Book
Review on Hemingway's Chair
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From reader reviews:

Nathanael Ma:

Within other case, little persons like to read book The Truth: A Novel. You can choose the best book if you
like reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a book The Truth: A Novel. You can add
know-how and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, simply because from book
you can learn everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will find yourself known.
About simple matter until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, you can open a book or perhaps
searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored to go to the library.
Let's examine.

Brian Bauer:

This The Truth: A Novel book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands.
The benefit you obtain by reading this book will be information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will
get details which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. That The Truth: A Novel
without we understand teach the one who studying it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't
end up being worry The Truth: A Novel can bring once you are and not make your handbag space or
bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This The Truth:
A Novel having excellent arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in
reading.

Debra Shortt:

Beside this specific The Truth: A Novel in your phone, it might give you a way to get nearer to the new
knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh from the oven so don't
possibly be worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have The
Truth: A Novel because this book offers to your account readable information. Do you sometimes have book
but you do not get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this in the hand. The
Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to
miss that? Find this book and also read it from today!

Elaine West:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many question for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some
people likes examining, not only science book but in addition novel and The Truth: A Novel or even others
sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel need to read more and
more. Science reserve was created for teacher or students especially. Those guides are helping them to
include their knowledge. In other case, beside science reserve, any other book likes The Truth: A Novel to
make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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