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Well known and well regarded in the world of science fiction and fantasy writing, Vandana Singh brings her
unique imagination to a wider audience in this collection of stories, newly reissued by Zubaan Books. In the
title story, a woman tells her husband of her curious discovery: that she is inhabited by small alien creatures.
In another, a young girl making her way to college through the streets of Delhi comes across a mysterious
tetrahedron. Is it a spaceship? Or a secret weapon?

The first Indian female speculative fiction writer, Singh has said that her genre is a chance to find ourselves
part of a larger whole; to step out of the claustrophobia of the exclusively human and discover joy, terror,
wonder, and meaning in the greater universe. A revolutionary voice in fantasy writing, Singh brings her
passion for discovery to these stories, and the result is like nothing of this world.
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From reader reviews:

Marie Clayton:

The book The Woman Who Thought She Was a Planet and Other Stories can give more knowledge and also
the precise product information about everything you want. Why must we leave a good thing like a book The
Woman Who Thought She Was a Planet and Other Stories? Wide variety you have a different opinion about
reserve. But one aim in which book can give many data for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to
closer along with your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, you may give for each other; you are
able to share all of these. Book The Woman Who Thought She Was a Planet and Other Stories has simple
shape but the truth is know: it has great and big function for you. You can look the enormous world by wide
open and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Ronald Ybarra:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a guide will give you a lot
of new information. When you read a publication you will get new information simply because book is one
of several ways to share the information or maybe their idea. Second, reading through a book will make
anyone more imaginative. When you examining a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring that
you imagine the story how the figures do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to others.
When you read this The Woman Who Thought She Was a Planet and Other Stories, you may tells your
family, friends as well as soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them
reading a guide.

Lucinda Brown:

The e-book with title The Woman Who Thought She Was a Planet and Other Stories posesses a lot of
information that you can study it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This book exist new know-
how the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world at this point. That is
important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you
throughout new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read that
anywhere you want.

James Labrecque:

You will get this The Woman Who Thought She Was a Planet and Other Stories by go to the bookstore or
Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for your
knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only simply by written or printed and also can you enjoy
this book through e-book. In the modern era like now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching
what your problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about your book. It is most
important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose appropriate



ways for you.
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