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When William Malm published his wide-ranging study of traditional Japanese music in 1959, it was the first
time in the twentieth century that such a work had been brought out in a Western language.

Malm's book has still not been replaced as the single most interesting and authoritative text on the subject.
But until now it was never revised or updated, nor were its illustrations ever changed. With the present
publication, however, an extensively improved edition that includes a CD of sample music has been made
available.

Professor Malm's aim has always been to attract the layman reader as well as the musicologist, which has
given this book its strength and durability. The writing is clear, lively, and informed, the scope of his study
being broadened by frequent comparisons with other traditions, East and West. Accompanying it all is a
generous number of drawings and photographs of the players and their various instruments.

The book opens with a brisk and eloquent history of Japan's musical life, then moves on to its religious
music, Shinto, Buddhist, and Christian; its court music; the music of the noh drama; and the music of
specific instruments: biwa, shakuhachi, koto, and shamisen. After examining the components of kabuki
music, it closes with a chapter on folk music, popular musical arts, and the music of other ethnic groups in
Japan. For the more technically inclined, there is a detailed appendix on notation systems. Lastly, to put all
this in a practical context, a CD is provided, giving nineteen examples of these different genres.

Whether your interest is in a particular form of Japanese music-the marvelous sonority of the bamboo flute,
the sharp but wistful sound of the shamisen-or just in music in general, Malm's book will more than satisfy
your curiosity.
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From reader reviews:

Sarah Alexander:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on
guys that aren't like that. This Traditional Japanese Music and Musical Instruments book is readable by you
who hate those perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable examining
experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer involving
Traditional Japanese Music and Musical Instruments content conveys the thought easily to understand by
many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different in the form of it. So ,
do you continue to thinking Traditional Japanese Music and Musical Instruments is not loveable to be your
top checklist reading book?

Terry Holmes:

The reserve with title Traditional Japanese Music and Musical Instruments includes a lot of information that
you can learn it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This specific book exist new knowledge the
information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to
yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you within new era of the the
positive effect. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Edward Trotta:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will
make someone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, classifieds,
book, and soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The actual
book that recommended to you personally is Traditional Japanese Music and Musical Instruments this e-
book consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This particular book was represented
just how can the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to
understand. Often the writer made some research when he makes this book. Here is why this book
appropriate all of you.

Jennifer Chambers:

Is it anyone who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Traditional Japanese Music and Musical
Instruments can be the solution, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are and so out of date,
spending your spare time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these
publications have than the others?
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