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In this large format book, internationally renowned photographer Henk van Cauwenbergh takes us on a tour
of the most famous and fabulous brasseries of Paris. No haphazard selection, but the favorite addresses of
Charles Aznavour (singer, actor and writer), Irène Silvagni (editor of Vogue Paris), Omar Sy (actor and best
remembered for his film Intouchables), Chico Bouchikhi (founder of the Gipsy Kings)... all of whom have
lent their cooperation to this unique project. They take you to cherished places: Brasserie Lipp, Café Costes,
La Closerie des Lilas, Le Comptoir des Saint-Pères, L'Avenue, Au Pied de Cochon, Le Bouillon des
Colonies La Société, Café des Deux Magots and many others... And of course they also make their
appearance in the photo selection. Every brasserie is extensively documented, with special attention to their
authenticity and the details that characterize the atmosphere of the space. Now and then, the photographer
surprises us with some tasteful 'images insolites' of Paris. This prestigious edition is introduced by the
photographer's good friend Charles Aznavour.

Text in English and French.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Figueroa:

Within other case, little individuals like to read book Les Brasseries de Paris: My Favourite Brasseries
(English and French Edition). You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. So long as we
know about how is important a new book Les Brasseries de Paris: My Favourite Brasseries (English and
French Edition). You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely
right, simply because from book you can realize everything! From your country right up until foreign or
abroad you will end up known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this
era, you can open a book or searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You should use it when you
feel weary to go to the library. Let's study.

Eric Green:

The book Les Brasseries de Paris: My Favourite Brasseries (English and French Edition) make one feel
enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable more increase. Book can to be your best
friend when you getting tension or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make reading
through a book Les Brasseries de Paris: My Favourite Brasseries (English and French Edition) to be your
habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about a
number of or all subjects. You may know everything if you like wide open and read a guide Les Brasseries
de Paris: My Favourite Brasseries (English and French Edition). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that,
science publication or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this book?

Michael Major:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information presently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider if those information which is within the former life are hard to be find than now is taking seriously
which one works to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Les Brasseries de Paris: My Favourite Brasseries
(English and French Edition) as your daily resource information.

Jennifer Lewis:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family, or their
very own friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic
within the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something
different to fill your current free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book can be option to fill your cost-free
time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you
want to attempt look for book, may be the e-book untitled Les Brasseries de Paris: My Favourite Brasseries



(English and French Edition) can be fine book to read. May be it might be best activity to you.
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