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Synopsis: Where did Paul find leaders for his new churches? How did he instruct and develop them? What
processes took place to stabilize the churches and institute their new leadership? This book carves a fresh
trail in leadership studies by looking at leadership development from a group-dynamic, social identity
perspective. Paul engages the cultural leadership patterns of his key local leaders, publicly affirming,
correcting, and improving those patterns to conform to a Christlike pattern of sacrificial service. Paul's own
life and ministry offer a motivational and authoritative model for his followers, because he embodies the
leadership style he teaches. As a practical theologian avant la lettre, Paul contextualizes key theological
themes to strengthen community and leadership formation, and equips his church leaders as entrepreneurs of
Christian identity. A careful comparison of the Corinthian and Ephesian churches demonstrates a similar
overall pattern of development. This study engages Pauline scholarship on church office in depth and offers
alternative readings of five Pauline epistles, generating new insights to enrich dogmatic and practical
theological reflection. In a society where many churches reflect on their missional calling, such input from
the NT for contemporary Christian leadership formation is direly needed. Endorsements: "In this highly
readably text, Jack Barentsen rises to the challenging task of using the latest thinking on the psychology of
leadership to provide a thoroughgoing, fresh, and highly convincing analysis of leadership in early Pauline
communities. The result is not only an excellent theological monograph, but also a model of integrative
scholarship that is much more than the sum of its theological and psychological parts. Indeed, as a forensic
case study of leadership this is very hard to beat--and there is more to be learned from this volume than in the
greater part of the vast managerial literature on this topic." --Alexander Haslam School of Psychology
University of Exeter "This volume offers a thorough account of the history of Pauline scholarship of local
church leadership, together with the most extensive and detailed investigation into the development of such
leadership across two ancient cities associated with the Pauline mission: Corinth and Ephesus. It concludes
by offering a consistent portrait of leadership development, together with some wide-ranging implications
both for this very important historical field, but also for modern-day church leaders. This is a most welcome
study." --Andrew Clarke Divinity and Religious Studies University of Aberdeen "Jack Barentsen's Emerging
Leadership in the Pauline Mission fills a large gap in our current understanding of the organizational
arrangements and leadership models utilized by the first followers of Jesus. This impressive monograph is
well researched, erudite in formulation, and provocative in its conclusions. I believe that it will become a
standard text for students of organizational leadership in the early Church." --Corne J. Bekker Professor of
Biblical and Ecclesial Leadership Regent University Author Biography: Jack Barentsen, born and raised in
the Netherlands, served as missionary church planter in his native country and now serves as Assistant
Professor of Practical Theology and New Testament at the Evangelische Theologische Faculteit at Leuven,
Belgium (www.etf.edu). He also serves as Secretary of the Institute of Leadership and Ethics at ETF,
speaking on leadership and offering consulting services to church leadership teams."
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Hartsell:

What do you concerning book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material if you want something
to explain what yours problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man? If you don't have spare
time to complete others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have spare time? What did you
do? Every individual has many questions above. They need to answer that question since just their can do
that. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because start from on
pre-school until university need this particular Emerging Leadership in the Pauline Mission: A Social
Identity Perspective on Local Leadership Development in Corinth and Ephesus (Princeton Theological
Monograph) to read.

Frank Monroe:

The knowledge that you get from Emerging Leadership in the Pauline Mission: A Social Identity Perspective
on Local Leadership Development in Corinth and Ephesus (Princeton Theological Monograph) may be the
more deep you rooting the information that hide inside words the more you get serious about reading it. It
does not mean that this book is hard to know but Emerging Leadership in the Pauline Mission: A Social
Identity Perspective on Local Leadership Development in Corinth and Ephesus (Princeton Theological
Monograph) giving you excitement feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in a number of
way that can be understood simply by anyone who read this because the author of this publication is well-
known enough. This kind of book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to
understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having
this kind of Emerging Leadership in the Pauline Mission: A Social Identity Perspective on Local Leadership
Development in Corinth and Ephesus (Princeton Theological Monograph) instantly.

Norman Ross:

Is it a person who having spare time then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or just
lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Emerging Leadership in the Pauline Mission: A
Social Identity Perspective on Local Leadership Development in Corinth and Ephesus (Princeton
Theological Monograph) can be the respond to, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are and so out
of date, spending your free time by reading in this fresh era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
ebooks have than the others?

Eunice Nunn:

In this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more precious than other.
Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time not very much but quite enough to possess a look at some books. On the list of books in



the top listing in your reading list is usually Emerging Leadership in the Pauline Mission: A Social Identity
Perspective on Local Leadership Development in Corinth and Ephesus (Princeton Theological Monograph).
This book which can be qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in getting precious person.
By looking right up and review this book you can get many advantages.
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