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Arm yourself to make the most of the versatile, powerful Ubuntu Server with over 100 hands-on
recipes

About This Book

Master the skills to setup secure and scalable web services with popular tools like Apache, Nginx, MySQL●

and HAProxy
Set up your own cloud with Open Stack and quickly deploy applications with Docker or LXD●

Packed with clear, step-by-step recipes to let you protect you valuable data with your own chat servers,●

code hosting and collaboration tools.

Who This Book Is For

Ubuntu Server Cookbook is for system administrators or software developers with a basic understanding of
the Linux operating system who want to set up their own servers. You are not required to have in-depth
knowledge or hands-on experience with Ubuntu, but you should know the basics commands for directory
navigation, file management, and the file editing tool. An understanding of computer networks is advisable

What You Will Learn

Set up high performance, scalable, and fault-tolerant back ends with web and database servers●

Facilitate team communication with a real-time chat service and collaboration tools●

Quickly deploy your applications to their own containers and scale your infrastructure as and when needed●

Find out how to set up your own cloud infrastructure for your internal use or rent it to the public●

Ensure quick and easy access for your users while also securing your infrastructure from intruders●

Set up a high performance private network with a personal VPN server and centralized authentication●

system
Swiftly start a content streaming service●

Set up network storage for private data and source code and say good bye to costly and unreliable cloud●

services

In Detail

Ubuntu is one of the most secure operating systems and defines the highest level of security as compared
other operating system. Ubuntu server is a popular Linux distribution and the first choice when deploying a
Linux server. It can be used with a $35 Raspberry Pi to top-notch, thousand-dollar-per-month cloud
hardware. Built with lists that there are 4 million + websites built using Ubuntu. With its easy-to-use package
management tools and availability of well-known packages, we can quickly set up our own services such as
web servers and database servers using Ubuntu.

This book will help you develop the skills required to set up high performance and secure services with open



source tools. Starting from user management and an in-depth look at networking, we then move on to cover
the installation and management of web servers and database servers, as well as load balancing various
services. You will quickly learn to set up your own cloud and minimize costs and efforts with application
containers. Next, you will get to grips with setting up a secure real-time communication system. Finally,
we'll explore source code hosting and various collaboration tools. By the end of this book, you will be able to
make the most of Ubuntu's advanced functionalities.

Style and approach

This easy-to-follow guide contains a series of step-by-step recipes ranging from simple to complex. Each
topic will start with basic introduction to each technology followed by a detailed step-by-step installation
guide and then a detailed explanation of the approach taken during installation and the various advanced
options available.
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From reader reviews:

Ella Butler:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to learn everything in the world. Each book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that e-book has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. These are reading
whatever they get because their hobby will be reading a book. Consider the person who don't like reading a
book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book when they found difficult problem as well as exercise. Well,
probably you will need this Ubuntu Server Cookbook.

Lisa McCann:

The book Ubuntu Server Cookbook can give more knowledge and information about everything you want.
So just why must we leave a good thing like a book Ubuntu Server Cookbook? Several of you have a
different opinion about book. But one aim which book can give many details for us. It is absolutely right.
Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you are able to give for
each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book Ubuntu Server Cookbook has simple shape but you
know: it has great and massive function for you. You can appear the enormous world by wide open and read
a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Daniel Gutierrez:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important normally. The book Ubuntu Server Cookbook was making you to
know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what
advantages for you. The reserve Ubuntu Server Cookbook is not only giving you much more new
information but also to be your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read
your publication. Try to make relationship while using book Ubuntu Server Cookbook. You never feel lose
out for everything if you read some books.

Randi Adams:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, planning to
beach, or picnic from the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to
something different to fill your free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book can be option to fill your no cost
time/ holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to
try look for book, may be the book untitled Ubuntu Server Cookbook can be great book to read. May be it
might be best activity to you.
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