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For the masters of the Chan tradition, poetry was a form of creative expression, but even more than that, it
was a primary vehicle for teaching. Here a modern master presents ten teaching poems from the ancient
masters, with illuminating commentary. “These poems flow directly from the minds of the enlightened Chan
masters,” Master Sheng Yen says. “We get a glimpse into their experience at the time of, and after, their
enlightenment. It is my hope that this collection of poems will give those who are interested in the practice a
new way of looking at Chan.”
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From reader reviews:

Suzanne Brooke:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Sure, you can
choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a go
walking, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open as well as read a book eligible The Poetry of
Enlightenment: Poems by Ancient Chan Masters? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You realize beside
you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with the
opinion or you have additional opinion?

Guadalupe Marshall:

The book The Poetry of Enlightenment: Poems by Ancient Chan Masters can give more knowledge and
information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the best thing like a book The Poetry of
Enlightenment: Poems by Ancient Chan Masters? Several of you have a different opinion about guide. But
one aim that will book can give many info for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer with the
book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you can share all of
these. Book The Poetry of Enlightenment: Poems by Ancient Chan Masters has simple shape however, you
know: it has great and massive function for you. You can appear the enormous world by wide open and read
a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Richard Thompson:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this The Poetry of Enlightenment: Poems
by Ancient Chan Masters e-book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book
which can be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written inside good manner for you, leaking
every ideas and producing skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still skepticism The Poetry
of Enlightenment: Poems by Ancient Chan Masters as good book not just by the cover but also by the
content. This is one book that can break don't ascertain book by its deal with, so do you still needing one
more sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already told you so why you
have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Leah Humphries:

Beside this The Poetry of Enlightenment: Poems by Ancient Chan Masters in your phone, it might give you a
way to get more close to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you will got here
is fresh through the oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow village. It
is good thing to have The Poetry of Enlightenment: Poems by Ancient Chan Masters because this book
offers to you readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you seldom get what it's interesting
features of. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here
cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss that? Find this



book and also read it from at this point!
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